
Milo Restaurant Proudly Joins the Oklahoma Route 66 Passport Program 

Oklahoma City, OK – April 9, 2025 – Milo, a neighborhood kitchen and bar nestled in the heart of 
Classen Curve on Beltline 1931 Historic Route 66, is delighted to announce its inclusion as an 
official stamp site in the Oklahoma Route 66 Passport program. This addition invites travelers and 
locals alike to experience Milo's unique blend of Oklahoma's rich culinary heritage and the storied 
history of the Mother Road.​ 

Embark on a Culinary and Cultural Journey 

Stretching over 400 miles, Oklahoma's stretch of Route 66 offers an array of memorable stops 
that celebrate the state's heritage and culture. The Oklahoma Route 66 Passport features 66 of 
these notable locations, providing travelers with a tangible connection to the past and a guide to 
exploring the diverse attractions and dining along the route. ​TravelOK 

Collect Your Stamp at Milo 

As a newly designated stamp site, Milo invites Route 66 travelers to collect a stamp in their 
passports upon visiting. This addition enhances Milo's commitment to celebrating Oklahoma's rich 
history and providing guests with authentic local experiences.​ 

Plan Your Visit 

Located at 6201 North Western Avenue, Milo adjacent to The Ellison, Oklahoma City, a Tribute 
Portfolio Hotel offers a menu inspired by milo sorghum—a heritage grain and key Oklahoma 
export. Milo’s culinary team brings experience, passion, warmth, and imagination to our visitors 
and local guests.   

How the Route 66 Passport Works 

To participate in the Oklahoma Route 66 Passport program, travelers can download the official 
TravelOK Trip Planner app, available on the Apple App Store and Google Play Store. At each 
participating stop, a code is displayed that travelers can enter to digitally check in. The passport is 
divided into Eastern, Central (milo is here), and Western sections. Upon completing all stops in a 
section, participants can visit one of the nine Oklahoma Tourism Information Centers to receive a 
piece of a Route 66 magnet. Completing all three sections earns a collectible Route 66 coin.  

About Milo 

Milo is a neighborhood kitchen and bar located in Oklahoma City, celebrating the state's rich 
culinary heritage through dishes crafted with fresh, local ingredients. The restaurant's warm 
surroundings and imaginative flavors provide guests of The Ellison, Oklahoma City, a Tribute 
Portfolio Hotel with a unique and authentic Oklahoman experience.  

​Embark on your Route 66 adventure today and make Milo a memorable stop on your journey through 
Oklahoma's rich history and culinary landscape. 

https://www.travelok.com/articles/oklahoma-route-66-passport?utm_source=chatgpt.com

